
12:00-1:00pm: Welcome, lunch and presentation
of collision statistics by University of Kentucky.

1:00-2:00pm: A Safe Systems Approach and the
Road to Zero, Ansley Kasha, Project Director,
Traffic Safety Research and Evaluation Group
(TSREG), College of Public Health, The University
of Georgia & Crystal Shelnutt, Region 10
Coordinator for the Regional Trauma Advisory
Committee, Georgia Trauma Care Network
Commission.

2:00-2:45pm: Creating a Culture of Roadway Safety
at Work, Matt Camden, Team Leader, Research to
Practice & Outreach, Division of Freight, Transit,
and Heavy Vehicle Safety, Virginia Tech
Transportation Institute.

3:00-3:45pm: Communicating for Rural Roadway
Safety, Sgt. Tracy Lillard, Illinois State Police.

4:00-4:45pm: Partnering with your Farm Bureau to
Advance Safe Roadway Practices, Callie Carson,
North Carolina Farm Bureau.  

5:00-5:30pm: Closing remarks for the day.

Take a free trolley with conference colleagues to
downtown Asheville for dinner on your own. 

8:00-8:45am: Continental breakfast.

8:45-9:00am: Welcome and setting the
charge for the day (identifying and advancing
solutions). 

9:00-9:30am: Address by NIOSH and NHTSA
representatives.

9:30-10:00am: Time to checkout of hotel.

10:00-12:00pm: Developing partnerships
and priorities for interventions.

12:00-1:00pm: University of Kentucky's
presentation of regional plans and funding
opportunities. Lunch. 
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